2005-2006 DEICING CHEMICAL PRICING SHEET

Bid No. 25079
Vendors AAT SALT COMMERCE INDUSTRIAL CORPORATE EXPRESS INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS SCOTWOOD INDUSTRIES SICALC
NOT TO SPECIFICATIONS
Comply Does Not Comply |Comply Does Not Comply [Comply Does Not Comply [Comply Does Not Comply |Comply Does Not Comply [Comply
We agree to accept "Piggybacking" X X X X X
LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
1. Magnesium Chloride, Liquid, bulk, inclusive of freight, handling & delivery
Full tank load: 4100-4400 gallons Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per
DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Eull Load Partial Load Eull Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Eull Load Partial Load Eull Load Partial Load Eull Load
RACINE COUNTY
14200 Washington Ave., Sturtevant, WI NA NO BID NO BID NA $ NA NO BID NA $ 0.94 INA
LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE NOTE: PARTIAL LOADS NOT REQUIRED BY AGENCIES, BUT PRICES ARE SHOWN FOR INFORMATION PURPOSES.
2. Liquid Calcium Chloride, Bulk, inclusive of freight, handling and delivery to the agencies specified
Full tank load: 4100-4400 gallons Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per
Min. partial load is 2,000 gal all Split Delivery Fee $85.00 Split Delivery Fee $50.00 Split Delivery H
locations. $30.00 per stop. after first drop
DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Eull Load Partial Load Eull Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Eull Load Partial Load Eull Load Partial Load Eull Load
CITY OF OAK CREEK
800 W. Puetz Rd., Oak Creek, WI NA NO BID $ 0.4266 $0.7266|NA $ $ 0.43 [NA $ 0.696 [ $ 09401 $ 0.425
RACINE COUNTY
14200 Washington Ave., Sturtevant, WI NO BID NO BID $ 0.4487 $0.7737]$ $ $ 0.425 $1.00] $ 0.696 [ $ 0.9401$% 0.425
Page 1 of 8



Vendors AAT SALT COMMERCE INDUSTRIAL CORPORATE EXPRESS INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS SCOTWOOD INDUSTRIES SICALC
Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per

DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load

CITY OF WAUWATOSA

11100 W. Walnut Road, Wauwatosa, WI NO BID NO BID $ 0.433 0.703|$ $ $ 0.435 $1.00] $ 0.696 $0.940| $ 0.425

CITY OF WEST ALLIS

6300 W. McGeogh Ave., West Allis, WI NO BID NO BID $ 0.433 $0.703] $ $ $ 0.435 $1.00 $0.696 $0.940] $ 0.425

CALCIIUM CHLORIDE, BAGGED

3. Calcium Chloride Pellets, 50 Ib bag, delivered on 40 x 48 pallets, inclusive of freight, handling & delivery

Full truck load: 1,045 bags, 55 bags per pallet Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per

DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load

CITY OF MILWAUKEE

DPW-BIds-Municipal Bldg. Garage N/A NO BID N/A $ 11.50 |N/A $ N/A $ 12.50 N/A NO BID N/A

CITY OF MILWAUKEE-HOUSING AUTH.

Hillside, 1419 N. 8th Street N/A NO BID N/A $ 11.50 |N/A $ N/A $ 12.50 N/A NO BID N/A
Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per

DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load

RACINE COUNTY

14200 Washington Ave., Sturtevant, WI N/A NO BID N/A $ 11.62 |N/A $ N/A $ 9.68 IN/A NO BID N/A

City of West Allis
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Vendors AAT SALT COMMERCE INDUSTRIAL CORPORATE EXPRESS INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS SCOTWOOD INDUSTRIES SICALC
6300 W. McGeogh Ave., West Allis, WI N/A NO BID N/A | $ 11.50 N/A $ N/A $ 13.00 |N/A NO BID N/A
WALWORTH COUNTY
Boiler House, W3929 Cty Rd NN, Elkhorn N/A NO BID N/A | $ 12.48 |N/A $ N/A $ 13.00 |N/A NO BID N/A
WAUKESHA COUNTY-HIGHWAY SHOP
Main Shop, 1641 Woodburn Road, Waukesha N/A NO BID N/A $ 12.04 N/A $ N/A $ 15.95 N/A NO BID N/A
4. Calcium Chloride Pellets, 50 Ib. Bag, picked up by the participating agency
NONE REQUIRED THIS YEAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE, BAGGED
5. Sodium Chloride (Crushed Road Salt) 50 Ib bag, delivered as requested by participating agency
Full truck load: 931 bags, 49 bags per pallet
Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per
Full Load Split Delivery $85.00
DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load
ELMBROOK SCHOOL DISTRICT
16945 W. North Avenue, Brookfield, WI $ 297 | $ 3.05 |No Bid No Bid $ $ $ 425 $ 10.00 |$ $ NO BID
CITY OF MILWAUKEE
DPW Parking 2.97| 3.05|No Bid No Bid $ $ NO BID NO BID $ $ NO BID
Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per
DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Eull Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load

CITY OF MILWAUKEE HOUSING AUTHORITY




Vendors AAT SALT COMMERCE INDUSTRIAL CORPORATE EXPRESS INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS SCOTWOOD INDUSTRIES SICALC
Hillside, 1419 N. 8th Street NA | $ 3.05 |NA No Bid NA $ NA NO BID NA $ NA
MILWAUKEE PUBLIC SCHOOLS
HIGH SCHOOLS
Bay View, 2751 S. Lenox St. $ 2.99 | $ 2.99 |No Bid No Bid $ $ $ NO BID $ $ NO BID

Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per Agency Cost per
DELIVERY LOCATION(S) Eull Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load Partial Load Full Load
WEST ALLIS/WEST MILWAUKEE SCHOOL DISTRICT
Administration, 9333 W. Lincoln Avenue NA 3.05|NA No Bid NA $ NA NO BID NA $ NA
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