
Bid No. 25023 (ME) = Motorola Equivalent

V.A.L.U.E. Bid for Batteries Yellow Highlight = Lowest Complying Bidder

Green Highlight = Lowest Complying Bidder for Motorola Manufactured Batteries

Item # Description Qty UOM Battery Jack Battery Zone
Interstate 
Batteries

Milwaukee 2-
Way

Milwaukee 2-
Way, Min. 
10 units Motorola Inc. Red Feather Tessco

1
Motorola Cell Phone, Ni-Cad, 
#VWM550NSG 1 Each No Bid No Bid $18.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.87

Make/Model Number CEL4180 SNN5571
Warranty 1 year 1 year 

Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 18 M 5
Total Line #1 $18.64 $18.87

2
Nextel 8971B, 1500 MAH Motorola, 
4.8 volt, nickel metal 1 Each $11.00 $10.50 $17.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.56 $12.75

Make/Model Number NTN 8971 CZNEX5 RAD04415 COM8971 NTN8971
Warranty 12 mo. 2 year 1 year 

Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 7-10 18 M 5
Total Line #2 $11.00 $10.50 $17.48 $12.75

3 Nokia 5165 1 Each $7.00 $12.00 $19.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.07 $10.42
Make/Model Number Nok5110 CZ6190 CEL0610 BNH610-9 BMS-2S

Warranty 12 mo. 12 mo. 1 year 1 year 
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 3-5 7-10 18M 10 WD 5
Total Line #3 $7.00 $12.00 $19.81 $37.07 $10.42

4
Motorola Startac 3.6 volt, Lithium 
ion, SNN4814B 1 Each No Bid $10.00 $25.54 $32.50 $25.50 No Bid $49.06 discontinued

Make/Model Number CZSTARSLI CEL3660
Motorola 
SNN4814B

Motorola 
SNN4814B BL152-1.4B

Warranty 12 mo. 1 year 12 mo. 12 mo.
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 7-10 18M 3-7 3-7 10 WD
Total Line #4 $10.00 $25.54 $32.50 $25.50 $49.06

5
Model CELN0610XT for a Nokia 
5100 1 Each $7.00 $12.00 $19.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.07 $10.42

Make/Model Number Nok5110 CZ5100 CEL0610 BNH610-.9 BMS-2S
Warranty 12 mo. 12 mo. 1 year 1 year 

Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 3-5 7-10 18M 10 WD 5
Total Line #5 $7.00 $12.00 $19.81 $37.07 $10.42



Item # Description Qty UOM Battery Jack Battery Zone
Interstate 
Batteries

Milwaukee 2-
Way

Milwaukee 2-
Way, Min. 
10 units Motorola Inc. Red Feather Tessco

6 3.6 volt, NIMH, TEL60 1 Each No Bid No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make/Model Number TEL0060

Warranty 1 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 18M
Total Line #6 $5.50

7

Battery for P100 handheld radio, 
Alexander H5451, OS5451 or 
equivalent 6 Each $17.50 $17.25 $36.40 $60.00 $38.00 $18.00 $29.95 $23.93

Make/Model Number HNN5451 (ME) BZ5451 RAD0030
Motorola 
NTN5451B

Motorola 
NTN5451B

Motorola 
NTN5451 EPP-5451

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 3-7 3-7 1-10 5
Total Line #7 $105.00 $103.50 $218.40 $360.00 $228.00 $108.00 $179.70 $143.58

8
Walkie-talkie batteries, #LM/MOT, 
7.25 volt, #3 JABBP9044 1 Each $5.21 $6.00 $8.14 $33.00 $23.50 $7.90 $8.68 $11.68

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
HNN9044 BZ9044 RAD0010

Motorola 
HNN9044

Motorola 
HNN9044

Motorola 
HNN9044 SBP9044 M9044

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 18 mo.
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18 M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #8 $5.21 $6.00 $8.14 $33.00 $23.50 $7.90 $8.68 $11.68

9
Ni-Cad HT90, Motorola NLN 
7435A, Alexander HT435 1 Each $15.75 $16.00 $38.11 $59.50 $42.00 $20.00 $32.55 $21.15

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
NTN7434 BZ7434 RAD0310

Motorola 
NLN7434A

Motorola 
NLN7434A

Motorola 
NLN7435 COM-7435 M7435

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 18 mo.
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #9 $15.75 $16.00 $38.11 $59.50 $42.00 $20.00 $32.55 $21.15

10
Ni-Cad Radium, Alexander H5459, 
NTN 5453B 2 Each $18.07 $17.50 $31.45 $69.75 $48.00 $19.00 $24.95 $22.92

Make/Model Number NTN5453 (ME) BZ5453 RAD1275
Motorola 
NTN5453B

Motorola 
NTN5453B

Motorola 
NTN5453 COM-5453 EPP-5453

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 7-10



Item # Description Qty UOM Battery Jack Battery Zone
Interstate 
Batteries

Milwaukee 2-
Way

Milwaukee 2-
Way, Min. 
10 units Motorola Inc. Red Feather Tessco

Total Line #10 $36.14 $35.00 $62.90 $139.50 $96.00 $38.00 $49.90 $45.84
11 Visar Battery NiCD NTN7395 10 Each $13.55 $20.00 $56.13 $94.50 $60.00 $29.00 $19.50 $26.44

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
NTN7395 BZ7395 RAD4040

Motorola 
NTN7395

Motorola 
NTN7395

Motorola 
NTN7395 COM-7395 EPP-7395

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 7-10
Total Line #11 $135.50 $200.00 $561.30 $945.00 $600.00 $290.00 $195.00 $264.40

12
Storage battery, #S-12260, 12 volt, 
AH26, size 6.89L x 6.54N x 4.92H 50 Each $30.65 $48.00 $35.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.51 $59.55

Make/Model Number B5737 GZ12260 SLA1146 UB12260 NP24-12BFR
Warranty 12 mo. 12 mo. 1 year

Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5 7-10 18M 10 WD 7-10
Total Line #12 $1,532.50 $2,400.00 $1,781.50 $2,125.50 $2,977.50

13
Battery for P1225 Radius 7.5, 1200 
MAH, 0S9049 or equivalent 1 Each $14.80 $17.50 $45.43 $78.00 $41.00 $19.90 $24.93 $23.48

Make/Model Number (ME) 9049A BZ9049 RAD9620
Motorola 
HNN9049A

Motorola 
HNN9049A

Motorola 
HNN9049 COM 9049 EPP-9049

Warranty 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #13 $14.80 $17.50 $45.43 $78.00 $41.00 $19.90 $24.93 $23.48

14
Ni-Cad, Alexander H8148, OS8149 
or equivalent 20 Each $13.05 $14.25 $31.73 $83.00 $47.00 $40.00 $15.54 $21.01

Make/Model Number (ME) 8148A BZ8148 RAD1325
Motorola 
HNN8148B

Motorola 
HNN8148B

Motorola 
HNN8148 COM-8148 EPP-8148

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #14 $261.00 $285.00 $634.60 $1,660.00 $940.00 $800.00 $310.80 $420.20

15 Lithium 3 volt Goldpeak CR123A 1 Each $1.90 $1.75 $2.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.51 No Bid

Make/Model Number
PanasonicCR-
123PA CR123A PH00010 Lith-8 Sanyo

Warranty 12 mo. 30 days 1 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 10 WD
Total Line #15 $1.90 $1.75 $2.99 $6.51



Item # Description Qty UOM Battery Jack Battery Zone
Interstate 
Batteries

Milwaukee 2-
Way

Milwaukee 2-
Way, Min. 
10 units Motorola Inc. Red Feather Tessco

16
Ni-Cad, Motorola HNN9628A, 
OS9628 or equivalent 236 Each $15.38 $14.50 $26.05 $82.00 $43.00 $16.50 $18.13 $20.86

Make/Model Number HNN9628A (ME) BZ9628 RAD1300
Motorola 
HNN9628A

Motorola 
HNN9628A

Motorola 
HNN9628 COM-9628 EPP-9628

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 20-30 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 7-10
Total Line #16 $3,629.68 $3,422.00 $6,147.80 $19,352.00 $10,148.00 $3,894.00 $4,278.68 $4,922.96

17
Motorola NTN 7394A Nickel Metal 
Hydride 1 Each $13.40 $22.00 $52.42 $115.00 $73.00 $66.17 $28.12 $28.97

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
NTN7394 BZ7394 RAD4030

Motorola 
NTN7394A

Motorola 
NTN7394A

Motorola 
NTN7394

COM 
7394nmh BNH-7394

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 12 mo. 12 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 7-10
Total Line #17 $13.40 $22.00 $52.42 $115.00 $73.00 $66.17 $28.12 $28.97

18
Motorola NTN 7143CR, HT1000, 
Alexander H7143, 1.3 AMP 1 Each $14.00 $15.25 $35.74 $68.00 $42.00 $16.50 $36.90 $21.93

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
NTN7143 BZ7143 RAD1830

Motorola 
NTN7143CR

Motorola 
NTN7143CR

Motorola 
NTN7143 COM-7143 EPP-76143

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #18 $14.00 $15.25 $35.74 $68.00 $42.00 $16.50 $36.90 $21.93

19
Ni-Cad MT1000, Alexander H5447, 
OS5447 or equivalent 1 Each $14.80 $17.50 $52.34 $93.00 $49.00 $19.00 $28.90 $23.93

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
NTN5447A BZ5447 RAD0070

Motorola 
NTN5447BR

Motorola 
NTN5447BR

Motorola 
NTN5447 COM-5447 EPP-5447

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year 
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #19 $14.80 $17.50 $52.34 $93.00 $49.00 $19.00 $28.90 $23.93

20

Motorola NTN7144CR NICD 1.5 
Amp, 7.5V or equivalent for 
HT1000 480 Each $14.00 $14.00 $27.49 $98.00 $44.00 $17.00 $19.53 $21.74

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
NTN7144 BZ7144 RAD1840

Motorola 
NTN7144CR

Motorola 
NTN7144CR

Motorola 
NTN7144CR COM-7144 EPP-7144

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year



Item # Description Qty UOM Battery Jack Battery Zone
Interstate 
Batteries

Milwaukee 2-
Way

Milwaukee 2-
Way, Min. 
10 units Motorola Inc. Red Feather Tessco

Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #20 $6,720.00 $6,720.00 $13,195.20 $47,040.00 $21,120.00 $8,160.00 $9,374.40 $10,435.20

21

Motorola WPNN4037A, NIMH 
1900ma 7.5 volt, intrinsically safe 
and non-incendiary 36 Each $37.00 $24.20 $88.74 $123.00 $88.00 $40.00 $70.21 $45.83

Make/Model Number NTN7341
(ME) 
BZ7144MHIS RAD4460

Motorola 
WPNN4037

Motorola 
WPNN4037

Motorola 
WPNN4037A HT-1000 060M540-37A

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 12 mo. 12 mo. Std. 18 mo.
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5-10 5 18 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #21 $1,332.00 $871.20 $3,194.64 $4,428.00 $3,168.00 $1,440.00 $2,527.56 $1,649.88

22
Motorola 7.5 volt, Nickel-Metal 
Hydride kit #HNN9008A 1 Each $17.00 $19.85 $24.25 $58.00 $43.00 No Bid $49.20 $27.26

Make/Model Number
(ME) 
HNN9008 BZ9008 RAD1045

Motorola 
HNn9008AR

Motorola 
HNn9008AR HNN90089A BNH-9008

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 12 mo. 12 mo. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18 3-7 3-7 10 WD 5

Total Line #22 $17.00 $19.85 $24.25 $58.00 $43.00 $49.20 $27.26

23
Motorola 2-way 10.8V/1000mAh

MiMh HNN9044AR 1 Each $9.11 $6.25 $15.38 $33.00 $26.50 $7.90 $16.25 $15.25

Make/Model Number HNN9044MH
(ME) 
BZ9044MH RAD0020

Motorola 
HNN9044AR

Motorola 
HNN9044AR SBP-9044 BNH-9044

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #23 $9.11 $6.25 $15.38 $33.00 $26.50 $7.90 $16.25 $15.25

24
Motorola 2 way 10.0V/1200mAh

Nicad NTN5451B 1 Each $17.75 $17.00 $28.52 $58.00 $38.00 $18.00 $35.95 $23.93

Make/Model Number NTN5451 (ME) BZ5451 RAD0030
Motorola 
NTN545LB

Motorola 
NTN545LB

Motorola 
NTN5451 COM-5451 EPP-5451

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std.  2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 14-18 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #24 $17.75 $17.00 $28.52 $58.00 $38.00 $18.00 $35.95 $23.93



Item # Description Qty UOM Battery Jack Battery Zone
Interstate 
Batteries

Milwaukee 2-
Way

Milwaukee 2-
Way, Min. 
10 units Motorola Inc. Red Feather Tessco

25

Stinger Ni-Cad, Streamlight 
flashlight, Streamlight 75175 or 
equivalent 1 Each $6.81 $5.25 $15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.87 $12.94

Make/Model Number FL20 BZ5318 NIC0748 MAG1 #75175
Warranty 12 mo. 12 mo. 1 year 30 days

Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5 5 14-18 10 WD 5
Total Line #25 $6.81 $5.25 $15.50 $21.87 $12.94

26 Maglight ML5000 1 Each $12.00 $8.25 $15.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $20.28
Make/Model Number SL20XP BZ20 NIC0086 ML5000 MSL20

Warranty 12 mo. 12 mo. 1 year 30 days 
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5 5 14-18 10 WD 5
Total Line #26 $12.00 $8.25 $15.99 $25.00 $20.28

27 Motorola H236 Intrinsically Safe 1 Each $49.00 $29.75 $54.97
This is not a 
valid

This is not a 
valid $70.00 No Bid $45.22

Make/Model Number HNN9010 (ME) BZ9050 RAD2740
Battery Part 
#

Battery Part 
#

Motorola 
HNN9011AR M9050

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year Std. 18 mo.
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5-10 5 18+ 1-10 5
Total Line #27 $49.00 $29.75 $54.97 $70.00 $45.22

28 CLTXP6 - 4.5 1 Each No Bid $7.00 $6.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.41
Make/Model Number GZ640 SLA0905 NP10-6

Warranty 12 mo. 1 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5 18M 5
Total Line #28 $7.00 $6.99 $22.41

29 6-Volt Lithium Battery CR245 50 Each $3.50 $4.85 $2.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make/Model Number 2CR-5M PA CR245 LIT0146

Warranty 12 mo. 30 days 1 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5 7-10 18M
Total Line #29 $175.00 $242.50 $114.00

30 Lithium 3 Volt Battery - Z123A 51 Each No Bid $1.75 $5.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.10 $6.33
Make/Model Number Z123A PH00010 Lith-8 Sanyo BR-2/3A

Warranty 30 days 1 year 30 days
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 7-10 18M 10 WD 14-21



Item # Description Qty UOM Battery Jack Battery Zone
Interstate 
Batteries

Milwaukee 2-
Way

Milwaukee 2-
Way, Min. 
10 units Motorola Inc. Red Feather Tessco

Total Line #30 $89.25 $305.49 $209.10 $322.83
31 9 Volt Lithium Everady L522 1 Each $6.47 $5.50 $8.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85 No Bid

Make/Model Number
Energizer 
L522 L522 LIT1003 AKL 9.v

Warranty 12 mo. 30 days 1 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 18M 10 WD
Total Line #31 $6.47 $5.50 $8.43 $2.85

32 Motorola NTN5414B 24 Each $13.80 $17.80 $32.19 $58.00 $48.00 $24.75 $21.18 $23.93

Make/Model Number NTN 5414 BZ5414 RAD0210
Motorola 
NTN5414B

Motorola 
NTN5414B

Motorola 
NTN5414B COM-5414 EPP-5414

Warranty 18 mo. 14 mo. 2 year 18 mo. 18 mo. Std. 2 year
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 2 5 18M 3-7 3-7 1-10 10 WD 5
Total Line #32 $331.20 $427.20 $772.56 $1,392.00 $1,152.00 $594.00 $508.32 $574.32

33 Streamlight SL-20 18 Each $12.25 $8.25 $15.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.18 $23.52
Make/Model Number SL20 BZ20 NIC0086 MAS-1 #77175

Warranty 12 mo. 12 mo. 1 year 30 days
Enter number of days for delivery 
after receipt of order 5 5 18M 10 WD 7-10
Total Line #33 $220.50 $148.50 $287.46 $453.24 $423.36


