Bid #25022
Janitorial Paper Products

NTS = NOT TO SPEC

American JAssociated Unisource
Item # Description UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express |Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate
Facial Tissue, 2 ply, 7.8" x 8.4",
Kimberly Clark, 100 per box, 30 to a
case, #21340 34|CASE $ 13.90 No Bid $ 13.39] $ 14.771 $ 16.251 $ 15.27] $ 15.29
Product Number| SCA #TF6810 #21340 #21340
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM
field)
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3] 2J7-14 45-7
Total ltem #1] $ 472.60 $ 455.261%$ 502.1819% 552501% 519.18( 9 519.86
Polypropylene Wipers, 12.1" x 16.8",
pop-up, Kimberly Clark, 180 per box,
#33352 16|/CASE $ 20.95 No Bid $ 20.341 % 22.44 1 No Bid $ 23.15] $ 23.25
Product Number #33352 #33352
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM
field)
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3 2]7-14 45-7
Total Item #2 $ 335.20 $ 325.44| $ 359.04 $ 370.40| $ 372.00
Shur-Wipes, medium duty, Fort
Howard, 12" x 10.3", 125 per box, 15
boxes per case, #298-15 73|CASE $ 25.20 No Bid $ 24461 $ 29.991 $ 38.05] $ 27.88] $ 38.92| $ 27.95
Product Number| KC#5320 #298-15 #5320 #298-15 KC 5320
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM 9x10.5, 125 per box, 18 9x10.5, 125 per
field) 2250/case per case box, 15 per case
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3 2]7-14 5-7 5-7
NTS NTS NTS
Total Item #3 $ 1,839.60 $ 1,785.58 $ 2,777.65 $ 2,841.16




American |Associated Unisource
Item # Description Qty UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express [Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate
Shop Rags/Wipes, disposable, 13-1/2"
x 13-1/2", quarter fold, Kimberly Clark,
18 packs of 50 per case, #K41200,
#265255 100|CASE $ 41.90 No Bid $ 40.69] $ 44.89 | No Bid $ 46.36] $ 46.47
Product Number #41200 #41200
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM
field)
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3 2]7-14 45-7
Total ltem #4 $ 4,190.00 $ 4,069.00] $ 4,489.00 $ 4,636.00 | $ 4,647.00
Wiper roll, Kimberly Clark, 9.8" x 15.2",
300 sheets per roll, 2 rolls per case,
#05820 12|CASE $ 30.50 No Bid $ 29.61]1 % 32.67 | No Bid $ 33.75] $ 33.82
Product Number| #5820 #5820
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM
field)
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3] 2J7-14 A45-7
Total Item #5) $ 366.00 $ 355.32| $ 392.04 $ 405.00 | $ 405.84
Work Horse Rag, Kimberly Clark,
heavy duty, 12 x 16.75", 150 per case,
#41300 32|CASE $ 14.35 No Bid $ 13.91] $ 15.34 | No Bid $ 15.84] $ 15.85
Product Number| #41300 #41300
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM
field)
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3] 2|7-14 A45-7
Total Item #6) $ 459.20 $ 445.121 $ 490.88 $ 506.88 | $ 507.20




American |Associated Unisource
Item # Description Qty UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express [Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate
Toilet seat cover, 2,500 per case, #HS-
HA2500 79|CASE No Bid $ 1.63]$ 15.47] $ 17901 $ 22801 $ 25.81] $ 18.50
Product Number| 310-2-01 RMC 25121973 #25121973 #25121973 #HG2500
Please note UOM you are quoting iff 14.5x 17",
different from what is requested 250 per Rochester
(reference both description and UOM dispenser & JRochester Midland Midland,
field) carton 2500/case 2500/case Rochester Midland
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 14 2J7-14 1-2 47-10
Cost conversion to 2500 $ 16.30
Total Item #7| $ 1,287.70( $ 1,222.13| $ 1,414.10 [ $ 1,801.20 [ $ 2,038.99 | $ 1,461.50
Sanitary napkins, Stayfree Maxi #4, 4-
1/4" x 3" x 1", boxed, 250 per case,
#147A 37|CASE No Bid No Bid $ 25.381 $ 22271 $ 23.981 % 32.34] $ 23.05
Product Number| #25130973 #25176768 #147A
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested Rochester
(reference both description and UOM Midland, Stayfree
field) #4, 250/case Rochester Midland
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2J7-14 1-2 A43-5
Total Item #8 $ 939.06 | $ 823.991% 887.26] $ 1,196.58 | $ 852.85
Tampons, Tampax, 500 per case,
#MT500 25|CASE No Bid No Bid $ 45331 $ 43.75] $ 54.35] $ 62.11] $ 45.25
Product Number| RMC 25176488 #25176488 #25176488 #MT500
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM Rochester Midland
field) Naturelle 500 ct. Silk Glide 500/cs JRochester Midland
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2J7-14 1-2 A4'3-5
Total Item #9 $ 1,133.25| $ 1,093.75] $ 1,358.75] $ 1,552.75| $ 1,131.25




American |Associated Unisource
Item # Description Qty UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express [Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate
Toilet tissue, (County-wide usage)
Single (1) ply, 4.5" x 4.5", 1,000 sheets
per roll, 96 rolls per case, SCA
10|#TS1630 378|CASE $ 39.251% 37.001% 42.821 % 38.111$ 3750 $ 37951 % 43.42] $ 39.75
Product Number| KC5102 IPCTT1 310-1-01 TS1630 #5102-80 #14580
Please note UOM you are quoting iff 3-3/4x4.5,
different from what is requested 1210 sheets, 3.8x4.5, 1000 shts 1 ply, 4.5x4.5, 1210
(reference both description and UOM 4.5x4.5, 80 rls/case, |1000 sh, 96]per roll, 96 Kimberly Clark, 2 ply, shts/rl, 80 ris/case,
field) 96,800 shts rolls/cs rls per cs 4.5x4.0, 80 rIs/case 96,800 shts
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3INTS 3 14 2]7-14 1-2 A5-7 NTS
Cost Conversion to 1,000 0.000405475] 0.0003854] 0.00044604] 0.000396979 0.000390625 0.000395313] 0.00041064]
Total ltem #10 $ 14,836.50 $ 14,405.58 ] $ 14,175.00 | $ 14,345.10| $ 16,412.76 | $ 15,025.50
Toilet tissue, Two (2) ply, 4.5" x 4.5",
Kimberly Clark, 500 sheets per roll, 96
11]rolls per case, #446 329|CASE $ 29.65 $ 34.451$ 28.791 $ 3176 $ 31401 $ 32.82] $ 31.75
Product Number KC4460 310-1-02 SCA #TM1610 #4460 #446
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested NTS Sheets Mainstreet,
(reference both description and UOM are 3-3/4x4- 4.5x4.5, 500
field) 1/2 NTS shts/rl, 96 rils/case
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3 14 2]7-14 1-2 45-7
Total ltem #11 $ 9,754.85 $ 9471911 $ 10,449.04| $ 10,330.60 | $ 10,797.78 | $ 10,445.75
Paper towels, natural color, 10.25" x
9.25", Second Nature, 250 per
package, 16 packages per case,
12|#SK1850E 643|CASE $ 11.25 No Bid $ 13.18] $ 12.781 $ 12.491$% 15.54] $ 13.65
Product Number| NPS 21940 PS4301 SCA #SK1850E |#470 #23504
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested Bay West, 1 ply, brown
(reference both description and UOM Prime Source, single single fold, 9x10, Georgia Pacific,
field) (same as spec.) fold, 4000/case 268/pkg, 15 pkgs/cs 250/pack, 16 per cs
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3 2J7-14 1-2 NTS 4 5-7
Total ltem #12 $ 7,233.75 $ 8,474.741 $ 8,217.54| $ 8,031.07 | $ 9,992.22 | $ 8,776.95




American |Associated Unisource
Item # Description Qty UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express [Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate
Paper towels, multifold, bleached
color, 9.125" x 9.5", Mainstreet, 250
per package, 16 packages per case,
13|#MB530 449|CASE $ 1590|$ 1525]% 23.131% 15.45| $ 14201 $ 14.481$ 17.61] $ 16.76
IPC
Product Number| KC1804 MB4000 310-9-01 #1804 #20204
Please note UOM you are quoting iff Kimberly Clark, Scott
different from what is requested 9.5x9.5, 400 multifold, white, 1 ply,
(reference both description and UOM (same as |per pack, 10 9.25x9.4, 250 per pkg, |Georgia Pacific, same
field) (same as spec.) spec.) pack/carton 16 pkgs/cs meas as spec.
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 14 27-14 1-2 45-7
Total ltem #13 $ 7,139.10 $10,385.37| $ 6,937.05] $ 6,375.80| $ 6,501.52 | $ 7,906.89 | $ 7,525.24
Paper towels, continuous hard wound,
no perforations, 7.875", natural color,
Second Nature, 800 linear foot per roll,
1416 rolls per case, #RK800E 781|CASE $ 14.50 $ 20.941$% 30.901 $ 14991 $ 14.66] $ 35.22] $ 16.75
Product Number| A6800 310-9-02 SCA #RKB800E #4142 #26301
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM 8"x375', 12 Kimberly Clark 12 Georgia Pacific, same
field) (same as spec.) roll per case |12 rolls/case rls/800' rl demensions as spec
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 14 2J7-14 1-2 A45-7
Cost conversion to 4,800 feet 0.0047] $ 15.45 $ 17.61
Total ltem #14 $ 11,324.50 $17,444.421% 12,066.45] $ 11,707.19] $ 11,449.46 | $ 13,753.411 $ 13,081.75
Paper towels, white, 2-ply, Fort James,
perforated, 100 sheets per roll, 30 rolls
15|per case, #273-00 215|CASE $ 15.85 No Bid $ 14.19] $ 15.341 $ 20.151 % 18.75] $ 19.90
Product Number| IPC KRT9030 SBFKRT85 SCA#1995 #273-00 #400 #27300
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested Bay West Green Seal
(reference both description and UOM only 90 sheets/roll, Stefco, 2 ply, 85 168 sht/rls, 15 roll, 11x9, 2 ply, 100 per
field) 30 rls/cs shts/roll, 30 rolls/case [rls/case Georgia Pacific roll 30 rls/case
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2]7-14 45-7
Cost conversion to per sheet 0.00587037| 0.005564706 0.006087302 0.006716667 0.00625 0.006633333]
Total Iltem #15 $ 3,786.39 $ 3,589.241 $ 3,926.31] $ 4,332.25| $ 4,031.25]1 $ 4,278.50




American |Associated Unisource
Item # Description Qty UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express [Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate
Sanitary napkin bags, wax or plastic,
3.5"D x 10.25"H x 7-1/2"W, 500 per
16|case, Hospital Speciality 260 24|CASE No Bid No Bid $ 15.15| $ 11.59] $ 11.751$ 16.17] $ 12.00
Product Number #25025088 #17 #260
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested Rochester Midland
(reference both description and UOM Receptacle Liner
field) 500/cs Rochester Midland
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 27-14 1-2 45-7
Total ltem #16 $ 363.60| $ 278.161 $ 282.001 $ 388.08 | $ 288.00
Brush, 3M, Light Duty, 20", 3M Product
17|#200002 1|EACH No Bid No Bid $ 182.60| $ 150.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 189.70
Product Number|
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM 3M General Purpose or
field) Extra Duty
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2J7-14 7-10
Total ltem #17 $ 182.60] $ 150.00 $ 189.70
Scrubbing Pad, 3M, white 20", 5 per
18|case 7|CASE No Bid No Bid $ 12.57| $ 13.971 $ 23.201 $ 12.23] $ 20.55| $ 15.35
Product Number| PAD4020WH1 3M#4100-20 N/A #3M 4100 4100N
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM NTS Niagara
field) 5/box NTS ACS 5/cs 5/case by 3M, 5/case
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2]7-14 A47-10 7-10
Total ltem #18 $ 87.99] $ 97.79| $ 162.40| $ 85.61] $ 143.85] $ 107.45




American |Associated Unisource
Item # Description Qty UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express |Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate
19|Black Strip Pad, 3M, 20", 5 per case 2|CASE No Bid No Bid 12.72 13.97| 23.2] $ 12.23] $ 20.55| $ 15.35
Product Number| PAD4020BLA 3M #7200-20 N/A 3M 7200 7200N
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM Niagara by 3M,
field) Premier Pad, 5/box NTS ACS 5/cs 5/case 5/case
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2J7-14 NTS 4 NTS
Total ltem #19 25.44 27.94 46.4 24.46 41.1 30.7
Scouring Pad, general purpose, 3M,
20)20 per box 84|BOX No Bid No Bid $ 3.55| % 20.67| $ 28401 % 6.52| $ 5.25
Product Number| PAD196 3M#96 3M#96 96-601A 3M 7200
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM Premier Pads 6"x9" 6"x9" green,
field) Green, 20/box 60/case 60/case ACS 20/cs
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2J7-14 A45-7
Cost conversion to 20 per package NTS 6.89] $ 9.47 NTS
Total ltem #20 $ 298.20| $ 578.76 | $ 795.20]1 $ 547.68 | $ 441.00
TMR/WMR-5 Cup, 5 oz. Double Poly,
21|2500/CS (For Water Fountain areas) 32|CASE No Bid No Bid $ 51.28]1 $ 88.99 | No Bid $ 68.43] No Bid
Product Number| DX558AC R53MD
Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested
(reference both description and UOM Poly Cup Dixie,
field) 2400/case Solo 3000/cs
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 2J7-14 4
Cost Conversion to per cup $ 0.0214| $ 0.04 $ 0.02
Total ltem #21 $ 1,709.33| $ 2,847.68 $ 1,824.80




American |Associated Unisource
Item # Description Qty UOM American Wiper Wiper Alt. |Bag Corporate Express [Kranz Nassco Inc. Red Feather Unisource Alternate

Toilet tissue, Single(1) ply, 4.5"x4.5",
KClark, 1,210 sheets per roll, 40 rolls
22|per case, #07101 150|CASE $ 29.70 $ 42.821 % 28.841 % 31821 % 37951 % 32.87] $ 32.90

Product Number KC SCA #TS1630 #7101 #7101

Please note UOM you are quoting iff
different from what is requested

(reference both description and UOM 1000 sh/roll, 96
field) rolls/case
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3] 14 2J7-14 NTS A47-10
Cost conversion to per sheet 0.000613636 0.00088471, 0.000595868 0.000657438 0.000395313 0.000679132 0.000679752
Total ltem #22 $ 4,455.00 $ 6,423.00] $ 4,326.00] $ 4,773.00 2869.96875|] $ 4,930.50 | $ 4,935.00

Towel-Hand Paper Double C Fold

23|#251-90 1000|CASE $ 19.08 No Bid $ 18.54| $ 14.771 % 14.441$ 17.01] $ 17.90
Product Number KC 1970 SCA #CB530 SCA #CB530 #495 #251-90
Please note UOM you are quoting iff Mainstreet C Fold,
different from what is requested White, 2400/case,
(reference both description and UOM 150 pks, 16
field) 3500 towels/case 2400/case pkg/case Bay West 2400/cs
Enter number of days for delivery
after receipt of order 3 2J7-14 47-10

Cost conversion to 2400/case 0.0055 0.006154167 0.006016667 0.0070875

©

Total Item #23 $ 13,083.43 $ 18,540.00] $ 14,770.00 | $ 14,440.00] $ 17,010.00 | $ 17,900.00




